[image: ]

[bookmark: _GoBack]Editorial Changes—Report No. 4
1 July 2017–31 December 2017
In preparing compilations for registration during the above period, First Parliamentary Counsel made the following editorial changes under the Legislation Act 2003.
The summary of editorial changes for the 65 compilations affected is as follows:

	Item
	Kind of editorial change
	Number

	1
	Changes to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives
	9

	2
	Changes to punctuation
	15

	3
	Changes to spelling
	12

	4
	Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement
	7

	5
	Changes to typeface
	24

	6
	Correct a typographical error
	8

	7
	Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
	12

	8
	Removal of redundant text
	1

	9
	Renumbering of provisions
	3

	10
	Reordering of provisions
	2

	11
	Updates to cross‑references
	1

	12
	Updates to references of a law or a provision
	5



Please note that each instance of the power being used in a compilation is counted. This means that for a number of compilations the power has been used multiple times (for example, to correct typographical errors in different sections of the same compilation).
Complete details of each use of the power within a compilation appears below:
Taxation Administration Act 1953, Compilation No. 150, Registration Date: 22 December 2017

Subsection 250‑10(2) in Schedule 1 (table item 36, column headed “Provision”)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 220 of the Indirect Tax Laws Amendment (Assessment) Act 2012 provided as follows:

220  Subsection 250‑10(2) in Schedule 1 (table item 36, column headed “Provision”)
Omit “61‑5(3),”, substitute “61‑5(2)”.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert a comma after “61‑5(2)”.
Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Regulatory Levies) Regulations 2004, Compilation No. 15, Registration Date: 21 December 2017

Regulation 65 (heading)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

The heading to regulation 65 refers to the “Offshore Petroleum and Greenhouse Gas Storage (Regulatory Levies) Amendment (Annual Titles Administration Levy) Regulation 2016”. The Regulation title should be italicised.

This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the Regulation title to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Extradition (Commonwealth countries) Regulations 2010, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 18 December 2017

Paragraph 8(1)(b) and subregulation 8(2)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update two occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
Customs (International Obligations) Regulation 2015, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 13 December 2017

Section 51 (heading)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

The heading to section 51 refers to the “Customs (International Obligations) Amendment (Anti‑Dumping) Regulation 2015”. The Regulation title should be italicised.

This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the Regulation title to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Therapeutic Goods (Medical Devices) Regulations 2002, Compilation No. 33, Registration Date: 12 December 2017

Subclause 2(3) of Schedule 1

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

The text of subclause 2(3) of Schedule 1 refers to “paragraph 2(d)” instead of “paragraph (2)(d)”.

This compilation was editorially changed by omitting “paragraph 2(d)” and substituting “paragraph (2)(d)” to correct this typographical error.
Extradition (Physical Protection of Nuclear Material) Regulations 1988, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 11 December 2017

Regulation 2 (definition of the Act)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

The definition of the Act in regulation 2 ends with a semi‑colon.

This compilation was editorially changed by removing the semi‑colon and inserting a full stop at the end of the definition to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Acts Interpretation Act 1901, Compilation No. 32, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Section 15C, subsections 28A(2) and 29(1) and section 34

Kind of editorial change

Changes to spelling

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update each occurrence of “authorize”, “authorized” and “authorizes” to “authorise”, “authorised” and “authorises” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Defence Force Retirement and Death Benefits Act 1973, Compilation No. 44, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 6A(1) and (2)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface 

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update three occurrences of the italicised words bona fide to regular font.


Subsections 43A(9) and 44(4)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Subsections 43A(9) and 44(4) contain the phrase “does not effect”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “effect” and substitute the word “affect” in subsections 43A(9) and 44(4) to correct this grammatical error.
Evidence Act 1995, Compilation No. 31, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Paragraph 93(b) and section 189 (heading)

Kind of editorial change

Changes to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update one occurrence of the italicised words in rem to regular font in paragraph 93(b) and to remove the italics from the italicised words voir dire in the heading to section 189.
Family Law Act 1975, Compilation No. 82, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subparagraphs 37B(1)(b)(ii), (c)(ii), section 89A, subsection 114AA(3) and paragraph 123(1)(h)

Kind of editorial change

Changes to spelling

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update each occurrence of “authorized”, “authorizes” and “authorizing” to “authorised”, “authorises” and “authorising” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.


Kind of editorial change

Changes to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update all occurrences of the italicised words bona fide, de novo, nisi and mutatis mutandis to regular font.
Governor‑General Act 1974, Compilation No. 19, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 2B(2) and (3)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface 

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update three occurrences of the italicised words bona fide to regular font.
Judges’ Pensions Act 1968, Compilation No. 28, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 4AB(1) and (2)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface 

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update three occurrences of the italicised words bona fide to regular font.
Marriage Act 1961, Compilation No. 26, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 88G(1) and 117(2A)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update two occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.


Subsection 93(3)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Subsection 93(3) contains the phrase: “the carrying out of a artificial conception procedure”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “a” and insert the word “an”, between the words “of” and “artificial”, to correct this grammatical error.
Parliamentary Contributory Superannuation Act 1948, Compilation No. 38, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 4B(1) and (2) and paragraph 17(3)(b)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update four occurrences of the italicised words bona fide to regular font.
Seafarers Rehabilitation and Compensation Act 1992, Compilation No. 31, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Paragraph 139(3)(a)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Paragraph 139(3)(a) refers to “a employer” rather than “an employer”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “a employer” and substitute “an employer” to correct this grammatical error.
Superannuation Act 1976, Compilation No. 59, Registration Date: 9 December 2017

Subsections 8A(1) and (2)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface 

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update three occurrences of the italicised words bona fide to regular font.
Migration Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 186, Registration Date: 7 December 2017

Clause 050.611 of Schedule 2 (heading)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 item 28 of the Migration Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 4) Regulations 2017 instructs to repeal and substitute clause 050.611 of Schedule 2.

This action repeals the clause heading but does not replace it.

This compilation was editorially changed to reinsert the clause 050.611 heading and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Higher Education Provider Approval No. 4 of 2016, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 16 November 2017

Paragraph 9

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

[bookmark: _Toc454205829]2	Commencement
		This instrument commences on 20 December 2016. 

The commencement date of the principal instrument was 22 December 2016. The amendment is unable to commence before that date.

This compilation was editorially changed to incorporate the amendment from section 4 as commencing on 22 December 2016 and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Remuneration Tribunal Determination 2017/11: Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full‑Time Public Office, Compilation No. 6, Registration Date: 15 November 2017
Table 3B of Part 3
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Clauses 1.10 to 1.12 of the Determination 2017/20: Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Public Office read as follows:
1.10      Clauses 1.8 to 1.9 commence on 17 October 2017
1.11      	Table 3B of Part 3 of the Principal Determination is amended by inserting the following entry before the entry for “Mr Eric Hutchinson, Administrator of Norfolk Island”.  
	Column 1

	Column 2

	Column 3

	Ms Natasha Griggs
	Administrator of Christmas and Cocos (Keeling) Islands
Effective 5 October 2017, refer Det 2017/20
	$41,840


1.12     Clause 1.10 commences on 5 October 2017.
Clause 1.10 is a commencement clause for clauses 1.8 and 1.9.  Clause 1.12 is a commencement clause intended for clause 1.11.
This compilation was editorially changed to incorporate the amendment from clause 1.11 as commencing on 5 October 2017 and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended. 
Charter of the United Nations (Sanctions—Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Regulations 2008, Compilation No. 9, Registration Date: 15 November 2017

Regulation 4

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 items 1 to 5 of the Charter of the United Nations (Sanctions—Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Amendment (2017 Measures No. 2) Regulations 2017 instruct to amend “Section 4”.

Section 4 does not appear. However, regulation 4 does appear.

This compilation was editorially changed to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Australian Defence Force Cover Act 2015, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 9 November 2017

Subsection 21(4)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended 

Details of editorial change

Schedule 4 item 14 of the Defence Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Act 2017 instructs to omit “of the person” and substitute “of a person under this Subdivision, except a classification described in subsection (5),” in subsection 21(4).

The phrase “of the person” appears twice in subsection 21(4).

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “of the person” (first occurring) and substitute “of a person under this Subdivision, except a classification described in subsection (5),” and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Airports (Building Control) Regulations 1996, Compilation No. 15, Registration Date: 8 November 2017

Paragraphs 2.16(3)(a), (b) and (d)

Kind of editorial change

Changes to spelling

Details of editorial change

Paragraphs 2.16(3)(a), (b) and (d) each contain a spelling error as they refer to “appproval” rather than “approval”.

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the spelling.


Paragraph 2.25(3)(c)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

Paragraph 2.25(3)(c) refers to the “Airports (Transitional) Act 1996”.

This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the Act title to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

Paragraph 2.25(3)(c) contains a spelling error as it refers to “aiport” rather than “airport”.

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the spelling.
Airports (Environment Protection) Regulations 1997, Compilation No. 7, Registration Date: 8 November 2017

Schedule 4 (note to Schedule heading)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation and update to a cross‑reference

Details of editorial change

The note to the Schedule 4 heading reads as follows:

“(subregulation 2.04(2), and subparagraphs 4.07(a) and (b))”.

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the comma after “2.04(2)” and update the cross‑reference by omitting the word “subparagraphs” and substituting the word “paragraphs”.
Radiocommunications Act 1992, Compilation No. 68, Registration Date: 8 November 2017

Subsections 305(2) and (4)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update two occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
Proclamation ‑ Murray Marine Park, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 2 November 2017

Paragraph (d)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Paragraph (d) ends with a full stop. However, paragraph (d) is followed by paragraph (e).

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the full stop at the end of paragraph (d) and replace it with “; and” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Air Navigation (Essendon Fields Airport) Regulations 2001, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 24 October 2017

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 2 of the Airports Legislation Amendment (Essendon Fields Airport) Regulations 2017 instructs, relevantly, as follows:
2  Amendments of listed provisions—Essendon Fields Airport
Omit “Essendon Airport” (wherever occurring) and substitute “Essendon Fields Airport” in the following provisions:
	(a)	sections 3 and 4;
	...
	(c)	section 7 (note);
	...
	(e)	subsections 10(3) and 12(1);
	(f)	section 13;
	(g)	subsection 14(1);
	...
	(i)	subsection 15(2);
	...

Sections 3 and 4, section 7 (note), subsections 10(3) and 12(1), section 13 and subsections 14(1) and 15(2) do not appear. However, regulations 3 and 4, regulation 7 (note), subregulations 10(3) and 12(1), regulation 13, and subregulations 14(1) and 15(2) do appear.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Essendon Airport” (wherever occurring) and substitute “Essendon Fields Airport” in regulations 3 and 4, regulation 7 (note), subregulations 10(3) and 12(1), regulation 13 and subregulations 14(1) and 15(2) and give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.


Note 1 to regulation 16

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

Note 1 to regulation 16 refers to “subsection 4AA(l)”. The letter “l” was used instead of the number “1”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “subsection 4AA(l)” and substitute “subsection 4AA(1)” to correct this typographical error.
Environment Protection and Biodiversity Conservation (Commonwealth Marine Reserves) Proclamation 2013, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 24 October 2017

Kind of editorial change

Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to set solid all occurrences of latitude and longitude by omitting the space after the degree symbol, the space after the prime symbol and the space before the initial capital letter indicating north, south, east or west.


Clauses 10.3 and 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table items 5 and 8, column headed “Description”)

Kind of editorial change

Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to omit all occurrences of the comma after the initial capital letter indicating south in the references to latitude and longitude in clauses 10.3 and 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table items 5 and 8, column headed “Description”), to bring these references into line with legislative drafting practice.


Clause 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table item 8, column headed “Description”, paragraph (b))

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Clause 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table item 8, column headed “Description”, paragraph (b)) ends in a semi‑colon despite being the last paragraph of that table item.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the semi‑colon at the end of the paragraph to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.


Clause 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table item 10, column headed “Description”)

Kind of editorial change

Change to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the reference to “South” from the occurrence of latitude in clause 10.5 of Schedule 2 (table item 10, column headed “Description”) and substitute “S” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Norfolk Island Continued Laws Ordinance 2015, Compilation No. 14, Registration Date: 23 October 2017

Items 1AA and 1AB of Schedule 1

Kind of editorial change

Renumbering of provisions

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 item 1 of the Norfolk Island Continued Laws Amendment (2017 Measures No. 2) Ordinance 2017 instructs to insert items 1AA and 1AB before item 1A of Schedule 1.

Items 1AA and 1AB already appear in Schedule 1.

This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the first occurring items 1AA and 1AB (as inserted by Schedule 2 item 1 of the Norfolk Island Continued Laws Amendment (2017 Measures No. 2) Ordinance 2017) as 1AAAA and 1AAAB respectively.


Headings preceding items 72A and 97AA of Schedule 1

Kind of editorial change

Updates to references of a law or a provision

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 5 of the Norfolk Island Continued Laws Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Ordinance 2017 instructs to insert items 72A to 72C after item 72 of Schedule 1. The heading preceding item 72A refers to the “Domestic Violence Act 1995”.

Schedule 1 item 6 of the Norfolk Island Continued Laws Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Ordinance 2017 instructs to insert item 97AA after item 97 of Schedule 1. The heading preceding item 97AA refers to the “Firearms and Prohibited Weapons Act 1997”.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert “(Norfolk Island)” after these Act titles to bring them into line with legislative drafting practice.
Proclamation ‑ Macquarie Island Marine Park, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 19 October 2017

Third note to the Schedule

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

The third note to the Schedule contains the phrase: Coastal waters”.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert an opening quotation mark before the word Coastal.


Schedule

Kind of editorial change

Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

The Schedule contains multiple references to latitude and longitude.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit all references to “South” and “East” in the Schedule and substitute “S” and “E” respectively to bring them into line with legislative drafting practice.
Veterans’ Entitlements Act 1986, Compilation No. 142, Registration Date: 17 October 2017

Schedule 2 (table item 10, Column 1, paragraph (iii))

Kind of editorial change

Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 (table item 10, Column 1, paragraph (iii)) refers to latitude and longitude.

This compilation was editorially changed to update the expression of whole degrees of latitude to 2 numerals and whole degrees of longitude to 3 numerals by inserting “0” at the beginning of each sequence of numbers, as required.

This compilation was also editorially changed to set solid these occurrences of latitude and longitude by omitting the space after the degree symbol and the space after the prime symbol.


Schedule 2 (table item 10, Column 1, paragraph (iv))

Kind of editorial change

Changes to the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 (table item 10, Column 1, paragraph (iv)) refers to longitude.

This compilation was editorially changed to update the expression of whole degrees of longitude to 3 numerals by inserting “0” at the beginning of the sequence of numbers and to set solid the occurrence of longitude by omitting the space after the degree symbol.
Defence Act 1903, Compilation No. 70, Registration Date: 17 October 2017

Section 116T heading

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the italics from the italicised words ex officio in the heading to section 116T.


Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update all occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
National Health (Weighted average disclosed price – October 2017 reduction day) Determination 2017 (PB 44 of 2017), Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 13 October 2017

Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1, items 21–25, 27 and 28 of the National Health (Weighted average disclosed price — October 2017 reduction day) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1) incorrectly describes the items to be amended by including a “$” sign to the monetary values in Column 3.  The “$” sign is not in the text of the instrument.

The compilation was editorially changed to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Regulations 1983, Compilation No. 52, Registration Date: 10 October 2017

Regulation 29 (table item 2, column headed “Species”)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the scientific name “Cassis cornuta” in regulation 29 (table item 2, column headed “Species”) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.


Subregulation 88C(1) (table item 4, Column 1)

Kind of editorial change

Update to reference of a law or a provision

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 26 of the Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Amendment (Permission System) Regulations 2017 repeals regulations 88C and 88D and substitutes regulation 88C. Subregulation 88C(1) (table item 4, Column 1) refers to “37AB of the Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Act 1975”.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert the word “section” before “37AB” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Antarctic Treaty (Environment Protection) Act 1980, Compilation No. 19, Registration Date: 3 October 2017

Section 14 heading

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the italics from the italicised words ex officio in the heading to section 14.


Schedule 3

Kind of editorial change

Changes to spelling

Details of editorial change

Spelling errors appear in the following items of Schedule 3—Protocol on Environmental Protection to the Antarctic Treaty:

1.	“Committee” is misspelt as “Committtee” in Schedule 3, Article 11(3);
2.	“Antarctic” is misspelt as “Artarctic” in Schedule 3, Annex III, Article 2(1);
3.	“arrangements” is misspelt as “arangements” in Schedule 3, Annex III, Article 8(2)(b);
4.	“account” is misspelt as “acount” in Schedule 3, Annex V, Article 6(1).

This compilation was editorially changed to correct these spelling errors.
Christmas Island Applied Laws Ordinance 1992, Compilation No. 9, Registration Date: 11 September 2017

Item 12 of Part 40 of Schedule 1 (heading)

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “delapidated” and substitute “dilapidated” in item 12 of Part 40 of Schedule 1 (heading) to correct the spelling.
National Health (Highly specialised drugs program) Special Arrangement 2010 (PB 116 of 2010), Compilation No. 74, Registration Date: 11 September 2017

Subsection 24(2)

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

Item 2 of the Schedule of the National Health (Highly specialised drugs program) Special Arrangement Amendment Instrument 2017 (No. 7) inserts paragraph (zb) into subsection 24(2). Subparagraph (ii) refers to “intitial” rather than “initial”.

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the spelling to “initial”.

Subsection 25(2)

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

Item 3 of the Schedule of the National Health (Highly specialised drugs program) Special Arrangement Amendment Instrument 2017 (No. 7) inserts paragraph (ze) into subsection 25(2). Subparagraph (i) is repeated twice in paragraph (ze).

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the typographical error by renumbering the subparagraphs in paragraph (ze).
Biosecurity Regulation 2016, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 8 September 2017

Subsection 117(3) and section 120

Kind of editorial change

Change the way of referring to or expressing a measurement

Details of editorial change

Subsection 117(3) and section 120 refer to latitude and longitude.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit all references to “ South” and “ East” in subsection 117(3) and section 120 and substitute “S” and “E” respectively to bring them into line with legislative drafting practice.
Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Act 1975, Compilation No. 32, Registration Date: 5 September 2017

Section 44 heading

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the italics from the italicised words ex officio in the heading to section 44.
Federal Court (Bankruptcy) Rules 2016, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 5 September 2017

Subrule 8.02(1)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Subrule 8.02(1) contains the phrase: “This rules applies to the following applications:”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “rules” and substitute the word “rule” to correct this grammatical error.
Federal Circuit Court (Bankruptcy) Rules 2016, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 4 September 2017

Subrule 8.02(1)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Subrule 8.02(1) contains the phrase: “This rules applies to the following applications:”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “rules” and substitute the word “rule” to correct this grammatical error.
Legislation (Exemptions and Other Matters) Regulation 2015, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 1 September 2017

Section 12, table item 9A, paragraph (a)

Kind of editorial change

Update to reference of a law or a provision

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from the Australian Participants in British Nuclear Tests (Treatment) Act 2006 to the Australian Participants in British Nuclear Tests and British Commonwealth Occupation Force (Treatment) Act 2006.
Safe Work Australia Act 2008, Compilation No. 5, Registration Date: 22 August 2017

Section 26

Kind of editorial change

Update to reference of a law or a provision

Details of editorial change

Schedule 12 item 35 of the Public Governance, Performance and Accountability (Consequential and Transitional Provisions) Act 2014 repealed and substituted section 26. Section 26 refers to “the Public Governance, Performance and Accountability Act”.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert the year “2013” at the end of the Act title to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Federal Circuit Court Rules 2001, Compilation No. 23, Registration Date: 17 August 2017

Subrule 20.00A(1) (table item 52)

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 item 28 of the Federal Magistrates Court Amendment Rules 2011 (No. 1) inserted table items 31 to 55 after table item 30 in subrule 20.00A(1).

Subrule 20.00A(1) (table item 52) refers to “compenstate” rather than “compensate”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “compenstate” and substitute the word “compensate” to correct the spelling.
Fuel Quality Standards Regulations 2001, Compilation No. 9, Registration Date: 15 August 2017

Subregulation 3(1) (definition of ACN)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 1 of the Fuel Quality Standards Amendment Regulation 2012 (No. 1) instructs to insert the definitions of ABN and ACN into subregulation 3(1).

There is no full stop at the end of the definition of ACN.

This compilation was editorially changed by inserting a full stop at the end of the definition of ACN in subregulation 3(1) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Family Law Regulations 1984, Compilation No. 62, Registration Date: 10 August 2017

Regulation 36 heading

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

The heading to regulation 36 includes the word “agreeement”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “agreeement” and substitute the word “agreement” to correct this typographical error.


Part 5 heading

Kind of editorial change

Renumbering of provisions

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering Part 5 to Part V to reflect the Part numbering within the rest of the regulations.


Regulation 67A heading

Kind of editorial change

Update to reference of a law or a provision

Details of editorial change

The heading to regulation 67A refers to “Part 5”.

This compilation was editorially changed to update the cross‑reference in the heading to regulation 67A by omitting “Part 5” and substituting “Part V”.


Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 refers to “Kazakstan” rather than “Kazakhstan”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “Kazakstan” and substitute the word “Kazakhstan” to correct the spelling.
Charter of the United Nations (Sanctions—Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Regulations 2008, Compilation No. 8, Registration Date: 7 August 2017

Paragraph 11A(2)(b)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 17 of the Charter of the United Nations (Sanctions — Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Amendment Regulations 2009 (No. 1) inserted regulation 11A.

There is no full stop at the end of paragraph 11A(2)(b).

This compilation was editorially changed by inserting a full stop at the end of paragraph 11A(2)(b) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Aviation Transport Security Regulations 2005, Compilation No. 51, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Subregulation 6.27AB(5)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 103 of the Transport Security Legislation Amendment (Identity Security) Regulation 2016 instructs to insert regulations 6.27AB and 6.27AC after regulation 6.27AA.

Subregulation 6.27AB(5) reads as follows:

	(5)	To avoid doubt, the person must give the documents referred to in paragraph (2)(a) (or any other documents given in accordance with alternative identification requirements) to the issuing body even if the person has previously give the same documents to the same issuing body in relation to another application for the issue of an ASIC.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the words “has previously give” and substitute the words “has previously given” to correct this grammatical error.
Maritime Transport and Offshore Facilities Security Regulations 2003, Compilation No. 34, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Subregulation 6.08BB(5)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 item 83 of the Transport Security Legislation Amendment (Identity Security) Regulation 2016 instructs to insert regulations 6.08BB and 6.08BC after regulation 6.08BA.

Subregulation 6.08BB(5) reads as follows:
	(5)	To avoid doubt, the person must give the documents referred to in paragraph (2)(a) (or any other documents given in accordance with alternative identification requirements) to the issuing body even if the person has previously give the same documents to the same issuing body in relation to another application for the issue of an MSIC.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the words “has previously give” and substitute the words “has previously given” to correct this grammatical error.
Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas (Import Levy) Regulations 2004, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Heading to regulation 4

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 1 of the Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas (Import Levy) Amendment Regulation 2012 (No. 1) inserted the definition of Management Regulations in regulation 4.

Regulation 4 now has two definitions.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “Definition” and insert the word “Definitions” in the heading to regulation 4 to correct this grammatical error.
Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas Management Act 1989, Compilation No. 30, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Section 7 (definition of quota period)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 8 of the Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas Management Legislation Amendment Act 2017 instructs to repeal and substitute the definition of quota period in subsection 7(1).

However, section 7 does not contain any subsections.

This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the definition of quota period in section 7 and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas Management Regulations 1995, Compilation No. 34, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Regulation 200 (definition of approved form)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 12 of the Ozone Protection and Synthetic Greenhouse Gas Management Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2017 instructs to repeal the definition of approved form in section 200.

However, the definition of approved form is in regulation 200.

This compilation was editorially changed to repeal the definition of approved form in regulation 200 and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.


Paragraph 223(1)(d)

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

Paragraph 223(1)(d) reads as follows: “what, if any, measures where taken to minimise methyl bromide emissions.”

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “where” and substitute the word “were” to correct the spelling.


Note to subregulation 331(1A)

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

The note to subregulation 331(1A) refers to “posses” rather than “possess”.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “posses” and substitute the word “possess” to correct the spelling.
Whitsundays Plan of Management 1998, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 4 August 2017

Subclauses 1.32(7) and (8)

Kind of editorial change

Renumbering and reordering of provisions

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 41 of the Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Amendment (Whitsundays Plan of Management) Instrument 2017 instructs to repeal and substitute subclause 1.32(7).

Subclauses 1.32(4)‑(16) are ordered alphabetically by a subclause heading.

The above amendment results in subclauses 1.32(7) and (8) appearing out of alphabetical order.

This compilation was editorially changed to renumber subclause 1.32(7) as 1.32(8) and subclause 1.32(8) as 1.32(7), and move the subclauses into numerical order.


Clauses 22 and 28 of Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Reordering of provisions

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 157 of the Great Barrier Reef Marine Park Amendment (Whitsundays Plan of Management) Instrument 2017 instructs to repeal Schedules 2, 3, 4 and 5 and substitute Schedules 2, 3 and 4.

The newly inserted clause 22 heading in Schedule 2 refers to the “Langford/Black Islands Complex setting 3 (moderate use) area”.

The newly inserted subclause 28(2) in Schedule 2 refers to the “Langford/Black Islands Complex setting 3 (moderate use) area”, whereas the clause 28 heading refers to the “Roberta Bay, Shaw Island setting 3 (moderate use) area”.

This compilation was editorially changed to reorder subclause 28(2) to subclause 22(2) in Schedule 2.
Fisheries Management (International Agreements) Regulations 2009, Compilation No. 7, Registration Date: 25 July 2017

Paragraph 7.2(b) of Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 128 of the Fisheries Management (International Agreements) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1) instructs to repeal paragraph 7.2(c) of Schedule 2.

This action removed paragraph 7.2(c) but left the “; and” at the end of paragraph 7.2(b) of Schedule 2.

This compilation was editorially changed to remove “; and” at the end of paragraph 7.2(b) and substitute it with a full stop to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.


Paragraph 7.5(b) of Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Paragraph 7.5(b) ends in a full stop despite being followed by a paragraph (c).

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the full‑stop at the end of the paragraph and replace it with a semi‑colon to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.


Subclause 7.1 of Schedule 3A

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 44 of the Fisheries Management (International Agreements) Amendment (2015 and 2016 Measures) Regulations 2017 instructs to insert clause 7 at the end of Schedule 3A, which reads partly as follows:

7.1		This clause applies to a person using a boat (other than a container vessel):
	(a)	that is carrying southern bluefin tuna, or products made from southern bluefin tuna, which have not been previously landed or transhipped at port; and
	(b)	that seeks access to a port for the purpose of landing or transhipment of the southern bluefin tuna or the products.

This compilation was editorially changed to replace all occurrences of “southern bluefin tuna” with “Southern Bluefin Tuna” in subclause 7.1 of Schedule 3A to correct the punctuation.
Customs (Prohibited Exports) Regulations 1958, Compilation No. 84, Registration Date: 24 July 2017

Subregulation 13CO(1) (definition of luxury goods list)

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

The definition of luxury goods list in subregulation 13CO(1) refers to “subregulation (5)(2) of the Charter of the United Nations (Sanctions—Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Regulations 2008.”.

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the typographical error by removing the brackets from around the number 5.


Part 2 of Schedule 8 (table item 6)

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

Item 6 in the table in Part 2 of Schedule 8 contains a spelling error as it refers to “theses” rather than “these”.

This compilation was editorially changed to correct the spelling.
Retirement Savings Accounts Regulations 1997, Compilation No. 55, Registration Date: 20 July 2017

Subregulation 7.4(1)

Kind of editorial change

Change to grammar

Details of editorial change

Schedule 10 item 3 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Fair and Sustainable Superannuation) Regulations 2017 instructs to insert regulation 7.4. Subregulation 7.4(1) of the new text appears as follows:
	(1)	The amendments made by items 6 to 11 of Schedule 1 to the Treasury Laws Amendment (Fair and Sustainable Superannuation) Regulations 2017 applies on and after 1 July 2017.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “applies” and substitute the word “apply” to correct this grammatical error.
Migration Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 185, Registration Date: 20 July 2017

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)

Kind of editorial change

Correct a typographical error

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 78 of the Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2017 instructs to omit “$1 720” and substitute “1 755” in subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3).

This compilation was editorially changed to insert a “$” before “1 755” to correct this typographical error.


Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 84 of the Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2017 instructs to omit “$165” and substitute “$170”.

There is no subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) (table item 2) in Schedule 2. However, there is a subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) (table item 2) in Schedule 1.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$165” and substitute “$170” in subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) (table item 2) in Schedule 1 and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.


Subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 112 of the Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2017 instructs to omit “$3 600” and substitute “$3 670” in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 1).

The amount of “$3 600” does not appear in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 1). However, the amount of “$3,600” does appear.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$3,600” and substitute “$3 670” in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 1) and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.


Subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)

Kind of editorial change

Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 113 of the Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2017 instructs to omit “$1 800” and substitute “$1 835” in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 2).

The amount of “$1 800” does not appear in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 2). However, the amount of “$1,800” does appear.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$1,800” and substitute “$1 835” in subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 2) and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Income Tax Assessment Regulations 1997, Compilation No. 76, Registration Date: 19 July 2017

Regulation 910‑1.08

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

The heading to regulation 910‑1.08 includes “Treasury Laws Amendment (2016 Measures No. 1) Regulation 2016”. The Regulation title should be italicised.

This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the Regulation title in the heading to regulation 910‑1.08.


Subregulation 995‑1.01(1) (subparagraph (b)(ii) of the definition of superannuation annuity)

Kind of editorial change

Removal of redundant text

Details of editorial change

The amendments made by Schedule 1 items 7 and 8 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2017 create two consecutive occurrences of “; or” at the end of subparagraph (b)(ii) of the definition of superannuation annuity in subregulation 995‑1.01(1).

This compilation was editorially changed to omit one occurrence of “; or” to give effect to the amendments as intended.
Therapeutic Goods (Medical Devices) Regulations 2002, Compilation No. 32, Registration Date: 12 July 2017

Paragraph 4.3(2)(b) of Schedule 2

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update an occurrence of the italicised words in vivo to regular font.


Part 1 of Schedule 4 (table item 1.3, column headed “Kinds of medical devices”, paragraph (d))

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 8 item 4 of the Therapeutic Goods Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2017 instructs to omit “or laboratory testing procedures” and substitute “, evaluation or laboratory testing procedures” in Part 1 of Schedule 4 (table item 1.3, column headed “Kinds of medical devices”, paragraph (d)). This action leaves no punctuation at the end of paragraph (d).

Schedule 8 item 5 then adds paragraphs (e) and (f) to Part 1 of Schedule 4 (at the end of table item 1.3, column headed “Kinds of medical devices”).

This compilation was editorially changed to insert a semi‑colon at the end of paragraph (d) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Therapeutic Goods Regulations 1990, Compilation No. 77, Registration Date: 11 July 2017

Clause 3 of Schedule 9 (table item 2A, column 2)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 1 item 2 of the Therapeutic Goods Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2017 instructs to add the following words “(other than subsection 9D(2C)” after “section 9D” in clause 3 of Schedule 9 (table item 2A, column 2). However, this would result in a missing closing bracket.

This compilation was editorially changed to insert a closing bracket after “subsection 9D(2C)”.


Clause 3 of Schedule 9

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 4 items 7–9, 11 and 13 of the Therapeutic Goods Legislation Amendment (2017 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2017 instruct to insert the numbers “12 300”, “49 800”, “29 600”, “199 000” and “118 400” in column 3 of table items 1B, 2 and 4 in clause 3 of Schedule 9.

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the space and substitute a comma in the numbers “12 300”, “49 800”, “29 600”, “199 000” and “118 400” in clause 3 of Schedule 9 to bring them into line with legislative drafting practice.


Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update all occurrences of the italicised words in vitro to regular font.
Safety, Rehabilitation and Compensation Act 1988, Compilation No. 69, Registration Date: 5 July 2017

Subsection 115(3)

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update an occurrence of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
Australian Communications and Media Authority Act 2005, Compilation No. 24, Registration Date: 4 July 2017

Paragraph 53(2)(m)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

Schedule 2 item 6 of the Enhancing Online Safety for Children (Consequential Amendments) Act 2015 instructs to repeal paragraphs 53(2)(n), (o), (p) and (pa). Paragraph 53(2)(m) ends with a semi‑colon but following the repeal is the last paragraph in the subsection.

This compilation was editorially changed to replace the semi‑colon at the end of paragraph 53(2)(m) with a full‑stop to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Australian Prudential Regulation Authority Act 1998, Compilation No. 36, Registration Date: 4 July 2017

Subsection 56(1) (paragraph (c) of the definition of protected document) and (paragraph (c) of the definition of protected information)

Kind of editorial change

Change to punctuation

Details of editorial change

The amendments made by Schedule 3 items 1 and 2 of the Superannuation Legislation Amendment (Further MySuper and Transparency Measures) Act 2012 left an extra semi‑colon at the end of paragraph (c) of the definition of protected document and paragraph (c) of the definition of protected information in subsection 56(1).

This compilation was editorially changed to remove the extra semi‑colons.
Customs Tariff Act 1995, Compilation No. 65, Registration Date: 3 July 2017

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update all occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
Disability Services Act 1986, Compilation No. 29, Registration Date: 3 July 2017

Section 14K

Kind of editorial change

Change to spelling

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to omit the word “fulfiled” and substitute the word “fulfilled” in section 14K to correct the spelling.
Student Assistance Act 1973, Compilation No. 53, Registration Date: 3 July 2017

Kind of editorial change

Change to typeface

Details of editorial change

This compilation was editorially changed to update all occurrences of the italicised words prima facie to regular font.
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________
28 Sydney Avenue  Forrest  ACT  2603
Locked Bag 30 Kingston ACT 2604 • Telephone (02) 6120 1400 • Fax (02) 6120 1403 • ABN 41 425 630 817
www.opc.gov.au
S17LA138.v18.docx

13


[S17LA138.v18.docx] [31-Jul-18] [2:37 PM]		Page  2

image1.jpeg
Australian Government

Office of Parliamentary Counsel





